
collecting areas have been founded. 
They have to create preconditions 
for the use of industrial production 
methods in agriculture by large 
scale amelioration systems which 
run far over a greater number of 
farms. The work of these associa­
tions will secure the planned co­
operation, an aimed management 
and a rational cooperative operation 
of the farms and enterprises and 
institutions of amelioration and of 
water supply just in the state of 
long-range operation and planning. 
The Amelioration Associations are 
organizational forms of long-term 
cooperative operation of plan and 
investment holders, employers and 
their agents in the sphere of amelio­
ration and water, supply. They 
provide the interdepence of manage­
ment and cooperative relations of all 
partners. The Amelioration Associa­
tions develop into organisms of a 
framework the operation of which is 
directed by the demands of the 
economic system of socialism.
By hand of the legal regulations and 
principles of operation agreed by the 
existing Amelioration Associations 
the author investigates legal ques­
tions of the structure, the method of 
operation and the contractual rela­
tions of the Amelioration Associa­
tions.

Fight against Criminality 
and Socialist Legal System
by Hans Weber and Heinz Wolf

The new Criminal Law of the GDR 
— as a subsystem of the socialist 
legal system — reflects the close 
nexus of the law. It makes it neces­
sary to enter these interrelations 
and to use their potencies for the 
prevention of and the fight against 
criminality.

Charakteristic of the developing 
socialist legal system is the increas­

ing nexus of legal regulations. Under 
the conditions of the developed social 
system of socialism the function of 
direction and control of the socialist 
state becomes more and more rele­
vant. Connected with this the task 
of the law increases in order to 
establish and to secure a stable 
relationsphip between the subsys­
tems and the entire system of 
socialism and to be a more exact 
ruler over the interrelations.
An unseparable part of this func­
tion of direction and controll of the 
socialist state and its legal order are 
the elimination of and the fight 
against social misbehaviour espe­
cially in the form of offences and 
their most drastic expression, 
criminality. They are one side of 
public operation in the process of 
the constant realization of the full 
accord of interests. The increase of 
the quality of direction and control 
of the social processes by means of 
the law thereby is a reserve which 
is not sufficiently used yet to 
eliminate anti-social behaviour.
Thus the creation of a comprehen­
sive public-social system of the pre­
vention of and the fight against 
criminality raises the question after 
the tasks of the legal system and the 
further development of our legal 
order as a whole by complex solu­
tions, the cooperation between the 
various legal branches and their 
approximation.
Criminality, its prevention and the 
fight against is a complex problem 
which demands to take a complex 
influence on the often rather com­
plicated social processes connected 
with criminality. That ist why the 
fight against and the prevention of 
criminality is not merely and mainly 
a matter of Criminal Law but 
because of the complexity of crimi­
nality one of all legal branches. 
Therefore it is necessary to inves­
tigate the mutual connection and the 
mutual interrelations of the single 
legal branches basically and to bring 
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